

SEP 28 2015

**REQUEST FOR AGENDA PLACEMENT FORM**

**Submission Deadline - Tuesday, 12:00 PM before Court Dates**

**SUBMITTED BY: Ralph McBroom**  
**TODAY'S DATE: September 22, 2015**

**DEPARTMENT: Purchasing**

**SIGNATURE OF DEPARTMENT HEAD:**

**REQUESTED AGENDA DATE: September 28, 2015**

**SPECIFIC AGENDA WORDING: Consider and approve renewal of RFP 2014 - 422 Asphalt and Asphalt Emulsions with multiple vendors at adjusted pricing to reflect decreases in fuel costs.**

**PERSON(S) TO PRESENT ITEM: Ralph McBroom**

**SUPPORT MATERIAL: See attachment**

**TIME: 5 min**

**ACTION ITEM: X**  
**WORKSHOP:**  
**CONSENT:**  
**EXECUTIVE:**

**STAFF NOTICE:**

**COUNTY ATTORNEY:**  
**AUDITOR:**  
**PERSONNEL:**  
**BUDGET COORDINATOR:**

**IT DEPARTMENT:**  
**PURCHASING DEPARTMENT:**  
**PUBLIC WORKS:**  
**OTHER:**

**\*\*\*\*\*This Section to be Completed by County Judge's Office\*\*\*\*\***

ASSIGNED AGENDA DATE: \_\_\_\_\_

REQUEST RECEIVED BY COUNTY JUDGE'S OFFICE \_\_\_\_\_

COURT MEMBER APPROVAL \_\_\_\_\_ Date \_\_\_\_\_

SEP 28 2015

	Vendor			Vendor			Vendor	
Vendor	Ergon Asphalt			Rooker Asphalt			Graco Texas Inc.	
	Pick up	Freight	Delivered	Pick Up	Freight	Delivered	Pick Up	Delivered
CRS-2	\$1.70	\$0.1389	\$1.8389	\$1.61	\$0.11	\$1.72	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2H	\$1.70	\$0.1389	\$1.8389	\$1.61	\$0.11	\$1.72	No Bid	No Bid
MS-2	\$2.00	\$0.1899	\$2.1899	\$1.90	\$0.19	\$2.09	No Bid	No Bid
HFRS-2	\$2.00	\$0.1899	\$2.1899	\$1.85	\$0.19	\$2.04	No Bid	No Bid
RC-250	No Bid	No Bid		\$3.10	\$0.28	\$3.38	No Bid	No Bid
AC-5	No Bid	No Bid		\$2.40	\$0.12	\$2.52	No Bid	No Bid
AC-10	No Bid	No Bid		\$2.40	\$0.12	\$2.52	No Bid	No Bid
AC-15P 3% Polymer	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
AC-15XP 2% Polymer	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
MC-30	No Bid	No Bid		\$3.15	\$0.28	\$3.43	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-1P	No Bid	No Bid		\$2.20	\$0.11	\$2.31	No Bid	No Bid
P2 Prime	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
P2 Prime Emulsifies Concentrate	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
Diluted AEP 40% H2O 60% Product	\$2.04	\$0.1389	\$2.1789	\$1.97	\$0.11	\$2.08	No Bid	No Bid
Diluted AEP 50% H2O 50% Product	\$1.73	\$0.1389	\$1.8639	\$1.68	\$0.11	\$1.79		
Diluted AEP 60% H2O 40% Product	\$1.41	\$0.1389	\$1.5489	\$1.38	\$0.11	\$1.49		
CWE/CWP2 Emulsified Asphalt	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
Hot Pour Liquid Crack Sealer	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	\$0.53
Rate of Demurrage Per Hour	\$80.00 Per Hour after the first 2 Hours			\$90.00 Per Hour after the first 2 Hours				
Minimum Order, if Applicable	This bid is for full transport load of 5,500 Gallon			5,500 Gallon Minimum			22,500 lb Minimum	
Other Fees	Pump & Hose Charge \$80.00 Per Load			Pump Charge \$150.00				

Vendor		Vendor			Vendor		Vendor	
Western Emission		Cleveland Asphalt			Heartland Asphalt		P2 Emission	
Pick Up	Delivered	Pick up	Freight	Delivered	Pick Up	Delivered	Pick Up	Delivered
\$1.27	\$1.3900	\$1.55	\$0.15	\$1.70	\$1.60	\$1.7211	No Bid	No Bid
\$1.27	\$1.3900	\$1.55	\$0.15	\$1.70	\$1.60	\$1.7211	No Bid	No Bid
\$1.35	\$1.4700	\$1.68	\$0.15	\$1.83	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
\$1.27	\$1.3900	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
\$2.90	\$3.0200							
No Bid	No Bid	\$2.70	\$0.15	\$2.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	\$2.50	\$0.15	\$2.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	\$2.50	\$0.15	\$2.65	\$1.90	\$2.0211	No Bid	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.15	No Bid	\$3.35	\$3.4711	No Bid	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.15	No Bid	\$3.30	\$3.4211	No Bid	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	\$3.35	\$0.15	\$3.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
\$2.95	\$3.14	\$2.10	\$0.15	\$2.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.20	\$1.45
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.99	\$2.24
\$1.60	\$1.72	\$1.30	0.15 *No returns on Diluted Materials	\$1.45	\$1.92	\$2.0411	No Bid	No Bid
\$1.35	\$1.47	\$1.10		\$1.25	\$1.62	\$1.7411		
\$1.10	\$1.22	\$0.90		\$1.05	\$1.32	\$1.4411		
No Bid	No Bid	\$1.55	\$0.15	\$1.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.74	\$2.99
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
\$65.00		\$80.00 Per Hour after the first 2 Hours			\$80.00 Per Hour after the first 2 Hours		\$80.00 Per Hour after the first 2 Hours	
5,500 Gallon Minimum		5,000 Gallon Delivery Minimum. Call for pricing under minimum			5,400 Gallon Minimum		No Min.	5,000 Gal Min
\$95 pump / hose		Pump/Hose No Charge			original freight			